
Aspiro Announces Ryan Ruzziconi as New President 

Green Bay, WI – December 12, 2024 – Aspiro is pleased to announce the appointment of Ryan 
Ruzziconi as its new President, effective January 2, 2025. 

Ryan received his B.A. with distinction from the University of Wisconsin-Green Bay and his law 
degree from Marquette University Law School. Ryan's career began in corporate law, and he has 
held significant roles as Assistant General Counsel for Kolbe Millwork Company and Vice President 
and General Counsel for Diplomat Specialty Pharmacy. At Diplomat, he was instrumental in the 
company's growth from $200 million to $5 billion in annual revenue and led the IPO effort to list the 
company on the New York Stock Exchange. 

Ryan serves on the Children’s Hospital of Michigan Foundation Board of Trustees, the largest non-
profit foundation in Michigan dedicated to children’s healthcare, disease research, and community 
health programs.  He also serves on the Brown County Children with Disabilities Education Board 
which oversees Syble Hopp School. Since 2023, he has been a community partner of Syble Hopp 
School and a sponsor of the Syble Hopp work study program. 

Linda Negratti, Chair of Aspiro's Board of Directors, expressed her enthusiasm for Ryan's 
appointment: "We are thrilled to welcome Ryan as the new President of Aspiro. His extensive 
experience and passion for our mission make him the ideal leader to guide us into the future. We 
are confident that under his leadership, Aspiro will continue to thrive and make a significant impact 
in the lives of those we serve." 

Ryan shared his excitement about joining Aspiro: "I am honored to be part of such a dedicated and 
impactful organization. I look forward to working with the talented team at Aspiro to build on its 
strong foundation and continue to provide exceptional services to its clients and community." 

Aspiro (www.aspiroinc.org) 

About Aspiro 

Aspiro was established in 1957 by a group of 67 parents of children with disabilities. Sixty-seven 
years later, and serving over 1,400 individuals and families, Aspiro still works to drive their work 
forward through seven different services: Building Full Lives, Day Services, Employment Services, 
Early Intervention, Group Supported Employment, Project SEARCH® and Respite Care. In addition, 
all Aspiro clients can participate in Aspiro's expansive sports, fitness and recreation activities. 
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